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a  Infección de reservorio braquial complicada con absceso subcutáneo

Totally implantable venous access ports (TIVAPs) infection with subcutaneous abscess 

CASE REPORT
A 64-year-old woman presented with a 48-hour fever. She 
was diagnosed in May 2018 with infiltrative left breast car-
cinoma stage pT1N0, HER2-positive and hormonal recep-
tors, and received treatment with lumpectomy, lymphad-
enectomy, radiotherapy and adjuvant chemotherapy with 
trastuzumab. She had finished the treatment 7 days before 
through a totally implantable venous access port. The pa-
tient came to the emergency room complaining of pain, red-
ness and swelling in her front right arm where the brachial 
port is placed (image 1) accompanied by fever. Suspecting a 
brachial port infection, the device was removed and empiric 
antibiotic treatment with vancomycin and cefepime was 
started. Nevertheless, as the swelling did not improve, a 
computerized tomography (CT) scan of the upper right limb 
was ordered showing a subcutaneous abscess (image 2) 
which was later drained by the General Surgery service. 
The blood, port and subcutaneous abscess cultures were all 
positive for methicillin-sensitive Staphylococcus aureus and 
the antibiotic therapy was de-escalated to cloxacillin during 
14 days after the first negative cultures were obtained with 
a clinical improvement (image 3).

DISCUSSION 
Totally implantable venous access port infections are the 
main and most dangerous complications of these devices, 
and they cause an elevated morbi-mortality1. The skin mi-
crobiome is the most important source of infection, thus, 
coagulase-negative staphylococci and  Staphylococcus 
aureus, are the most common isolates2. Empiric antibiotic 
therapy must cover gram-positive cocci (including methi-
cillin-resistant Staphylococcus aureus) and gram-negative 
bacilli (including Pseudomonas aeruginosa)2,3. The duration 
of antibiotic treatment should last 10-14 days after the first 
negative blood culture is obtained2. The removal of the 
catheter should be performed in case of sepsis, Staphylo-
coccus aureus, Candida spp or Mycobacterium infection, 
septic embolisms, persistent bacteraemia after 72 hours of 
treatment with correct antibiotic or local signs of infection1,2. 
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Figure 1. Right arm where the brachial port is placed

Figure. 2. Computerized tomography scan of
the upper right limb: a subcutaneous abscess was observed. 

Figure. 3. Right arm after treatment
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